
MEMORANDUM
COUNTY OF PLACER
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION

TO: . Honorable Board of Supervisors

FROM: Jim Boggan, Purchasing Manager fJl3
DATE: May 26,2009

SUBJECT: Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No. 9882 to West Coast Sand &
Gravel, Butte Sand &Gravel, Robinson Sand & Gravel, Cinderlite Trucking,
and Sutter Transfer Service for Aggregate Materials and Hauling in the
Maximum Aggregate Amount of $413,200.00

ACTION REQUESTED

Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 9882 to West Coast Sand & Gravel of
Sacramento, Butte Sand & Gravel of Sutter, Robinson Sand & Gravel of Auburn, Cinderlite
Trucking of Carson City, and Sutter Transfer Service of Sutter, for aggregate materials and
hauling services as detailed in Exhibit A in the maximum aggregate amount of
$413,200.00, and authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resulting blanket purchase
orders (BPO) and to transfer funds between BPOs as necessary to meet the County's
needs.

BACKGROUND

The Department of Public Works - Road Maintenance Division requires annual contracts
for the purchase and delivery of aggregate materials as-needed for various road
maintenance projects. Bid No. 9882 was faxed to 8 potential vendors and distributed via
the County's E-Bid system to 28 potential vendors. The bid was also posted on the County
website. A total of eleven responsive bids were received. Local vendor preference and
prompt payment discounts were considered in the bid evaluation. A summary of the
recommended awards and contract amounts is submitted as Exhibits A and B. The
complete bid evaluation is on file with the Clerk of the Board.

FISCAL IMPACT

Five blanket purchase orders resulting from this recommendation will be issued in the
maximum aggregate amount of $413,200.00 for the period of May 26, 2009 through March
31,2010. The Department of Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statemen,t is attached.

Attachments: 1) Exhibits A and B - Summary of Recommended Awards and Rankings
2) Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statement .

cc: Kevin Taber, Public Works
Cynthia Taylor, Public Works
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SUMMARY OF RECOMMENDED AWARDS

$ 268;800.00
$ 7,900.00
$ 38,500.00
$ 8,200.00
$ 89,800.00

$ 413,200.00 I

West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento,
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

[_. T.....O.....T_A...L_A.....W_A_R....D_A.....M_O_U_NT ......

J. Manning 5/6/2009 l.P1



Bid No. 9882 - Aggregates RANKINGS

WESTERN PLACER COUNTY

Exhibit B
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Category 1 • 3/4" Class II Aggregate Base
Destination: Roseville, Cavitt Stallman, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder Mine ID Information
Rank

1
2

6'
7
8
9

West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Briggs Trucking, Aubum

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento

CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009
Westem Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (1.1 ­
1.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09­
0005 (14 - 1.6)
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (1.1 ­
14), Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
(1.5), and Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31­
0004 (1.6)
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (1.1 - 13), and
Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31-0004 (14­
1.6)
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (1.1, 1.3), and
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (1.2, 14
- 1.6)
Westem Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0006
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Name of Hauler Combined Total Price

West Coast S&G, Sacramento $ 88,359.36
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter $ 92,751.50

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutler 94,019.10

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 97,318.78

Briggs Trucking, Aubum $ 105,64045

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 105,92919
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City $ 111,71438
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley $ 115,556.88
Hastie's Capitol S&G, Sacramento $ 128,209.03

No Bid
No Bid

Category 3 - 1/2" Crushed Drain Rock
Destinations: RoseVille, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

RODinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Hansen Bros. En!., Grass Valley

Mine ID Information

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (3.1 &
3.2), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09­
0005 (3.3 - 3.5)
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (3.1 ­
3.3), Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
(34), and Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31­
0004 (3.5)
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (3.1 & 3.2), and
Teicher1 Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (3.3 ­
3.5)
CEMEX. ID #91-31-0009 (3.1 - 3.3, 3.5) and
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
Teichert Aggregates. ID #91-09-0005

Name of Hauler

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
West Coast S&G, Sacramenlo

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutler
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Hastie's Capitol S&G, Sacramento

$
$

$

$

$
$
$
$

Combined Total Price

21,440.06
22,65398

24,142.34

24,490.82

24,558.68
27,230.00
28,542.72
31,881.19

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 4 - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock
Destinations: Roseville, Cavitt Stallman, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder Mine 10 Information Name of Hauler \ Combined Total Price
Rank

1 West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Sutter Transfer Service. Sutter

Blain Stumpf Trucking. Shingle Springs

4 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter

CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009
Western Aggregates. ID #91-58-0001 (4.1 ­
4.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09­

.0005 (44 - 4.6)
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (4.1 ­
44), Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
(4.5), and Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31­
0004 (46)
CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (4.1, 4.3), and
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (4.2,44
- 4.6)

CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (4.1 - 44, 4.6), and
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (4.5)

West Coast S&G, Sacramento

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn .

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter

$

$

$

50,189.16

50,398.03

53,616.94

54,006.29

56,80913

6
7
8

Briggs Trucking, Auburn
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Cinderlite Trucking Corp, Carson City
Granite Construction Co, SacramenlO
Hansen Bros. En!., Grass Valley

J. Manning

CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (4.1 - 4.3), Teichert
Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (44 - 4.5), and
Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31-0004 (4.6)
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Briggs Trucking, Auburn
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol S&G, Sacramento

$
$
$

59,518,47
59,988.00
72,819.93

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

5/6/2009~



Bid No. 9882 - Aggregates

Category 6 - 1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder

RANKINGS

Mine ID Information Name of Hauler

Exhibit B
Page 2 of 4

Combined Total Price

3

4
5
6
7
8

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Cinder1ite Trucking COfll, Carson City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Hansen Bros. Ent., Grass Valley

CEMEX, ID #91-31-0009 (6.1 - 6.2), and
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005 (6.3 ­
6.5)
Butte SSG, 10 #91-51-0001
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005 (6.1 ­
6.4), and Chevreaux Aggregates, 10 #91-31­
0004 (6.5)
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005 (6.1 ­
6.4), and Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31­
0004 (6.5)
Chevreaux Aggregates, to #91-31-0004
Knife River, 10 #91-58-0002
Teicher1 Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
West Coast S&G, Sacramento

Blain Siumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Briggs Trucking, Aubum
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol S&G, Sacramento

$
$

$
$
$
$
$

36,138.51
38,360.03

39,433.95

42,340.48
42,585.38
45,378.05
46,847.31
56,80109

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 8 - 4 x 12 Rip Rap
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder Mine ID Information Name of Hauler' Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4
5
6
7

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Cinder1ite Trucking' COfll., Carson City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City

Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0007
Hansen Bros., 10 #91-29-0007
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Nordic Ind, 10 #04-04-149
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

. West Coast S&G, Sacramento
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Briggs Trucking, Aubum

$
$
$
$
$
$
$

20,790.93
23,338.70
24,560.32
26,308.13
26,841.38
26,952.35
47,878.78

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 10 - 4 x 12 Cobble
Destinations: Foresthill, Colfax

Mine ID Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter.
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Btain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Cinder1ite Trucking COfll., Carson City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Hansen Bros. Ent., Grass Valley

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001
SRI Supreme, 10 #04-05-403
Westem Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001
Teichert Aggregates 10 #91-34-0006
Teichert Aggregates 10 #91-34-0006

Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
West Coast S&G, Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Hasties Capitol S&G, Sacramento
Briggs Trucking, Auburn

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

7,877.85
7,906.63
8,305.61
9,349.79
9,450.76

10,037.00
11,169.64
75,257.62

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 12 - 5/16" x 8 Chips
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Bidder Mine ID Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8

West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Cindertite Trucking COW, Carson City
Hansen Bros. Ent., Grass Valley
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09·0005
Chevreaux Aggregates, 10 #91-31-0004
Green Valley Holding, 10#91-31-004
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-34-0006
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0006
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Chevreaux Aggregates, 10 #91-31-0004
Granite Construction, 10 #91-34-0043

West Coast S&G, Sacramento
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Larry Jenkins Trucking

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

127,567.69
162,235.48
166,645.20
167,464.63
171,243.45
171,432.81
178,588.57
201,669.75

No Sid
No Bid
No Bid

J Manning 5/6/2009



Bid No. 9882 - Aggregates

Category 2 • 3/4" Class II Aggregate Base
Destination: Serene Lakes and Tahoe City

Bidder

RANKINGS

EASTERN PLACER COUNTY

Mine ID Information Name of Hauler

Exhibit B
Page 3 of 4

Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4
5

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindenite Trucking, Carson City
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Briggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Btain Stumpf Trucking, Shingte Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Granite Construction, ID #26-02-204
Cindenite, 10 #26-02647
Hansen Bros., 10 #91-29-0006
Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31-0004
Westem Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindenlte Trucking, Carson City
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Briggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City

$
$
$
$
$

13,560,18
14,245.70
21,271.13
21,354.76
24,925.38

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 5 - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock·
Destination: Tahoe City

Mine 10 Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
B.ank

1
2
3
4

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindenite Trucking, Carson City
Briggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Granite Construction, ID #26-02-204
Cindenite, 10 #26-02647
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Westem Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindenite Trucking, Carson City
Briggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City

$
$
$
$

4,350.56
4,438.25
6,99473
7,732.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 7 "1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock
Destination: Tahoe City

Mine 10 Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindenite Trucking, Carson City
Briggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robins'on Sand & Gravel, Aubum
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Granite Construction, 10 #26-02-204
Cindenite, iO #26-02647
Chevreaux Aggregates, 10 #91-31-0004
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cindeni!e Trucking, Carson City
Bnggs Trucking, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City

$
$
$
$

2,170.95
2,219.13
3,405.07
3,488.44

No Bid
No Bid
No. Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 9 - 4 x 12 Rip Rap
Destination: Tahoe City

Mine 10 Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4

Cinderlite Trucking, Carso!' City
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City

Cinderlite, ID #26-02647
Granite Construction, 10 #26-02-204
Hansen Bros., 10 #91-29-0007
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09'0005

Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Briggs Trucking, Aubum

$
$
$
$

8,199.94
8,904.71

11,414.96
26,257.59

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

J. Manning 5/6/2009 &1



Bid No. 9882 - Aggregates

Category 11 - 4 x 12 Cobble
Destination: Tahoe City

RANKINGS

Mine ID Information Name of Hauler

Exhibit B
Page 4 of 4

Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Granite Construction Co., Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte·Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Teichert Aggregates, 10 #04-01679
Cinderlite, 10 #26-02647
Western Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0001
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-58-0006

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn

$
$
$
$

5,434.13
5,466.63
8,848.50

19,673.16
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Category 13 - 5/16" x 8 Chips
Destinations: Serene Lakes, Tahoe City

Bidder Mine 10 Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank

1
2
3
4
5

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Granite Construction, Sacramento
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Butte Sand & Gravel, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
West Coast Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Granite Construction, 10 #26-02-204
Dayton Materials, 10 #26-02412
Teichert Aggregates, 10 #91-09-0005
Chevreaux Aggregates, 10 #91-31-0004
Granite Construction, 10 #91-34-0043

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JA-CO Trucking, Yuba City
Briggs Trucking, Auburn
Larry Jenkins Trucking

$
$
$
$
$

22,041.42
32,50748
42,249.75
42,459.60
55,90247

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

J. Manning 51612009 ~g



MEMORANDUM

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
County of Placer

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors . DATE: May 26, 2009

FROM: Ken Grehm, Director

SUBJECT: FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT
Annual Aggregate Hauling Contracts

The department has budgeted appropriately for this BPO and funding is available in the FY
2008-09 department budget in Fund 120.
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